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nearly 27 successful years with the California 
Cable & Telecommunications Association. As 
Dennis enters the next phase in his life and 
his family and friends gather to celebrate his 
illustrious career, I ask that all my colleagues 
join me in honoring his many remarkable ac-
complishments. 

For the last 27 years, Dennis has been a 
tireless pioneer for the cable industry. As a 
chief lobbyist and then the head of the Cali-
fornia Cable & Telecommunications Associa-
tion, Dennis has garnered many accolades for 
his efforts. In 1994, he was given the Brad 
Wojcoski Award, an honor reserved to recog-
nize a cable and telecommunications industry 
employee whose efforts have made a signifi-
cant impact in the fight against HIV and AIDS 
in their local community. In 1998 he received 
the Vanguard Award, which is the cable indus-
try’s highest decoration for outstanding service 
at the State and regional level. And in 2004, 
Dennis was inducted into the Cable Center’s 
Cable Pioneer Exhibit, which applauds 
groundbreaking leaders in the cable industry. 

In addition to his invaluable work in the pri-
vate sector for the cable industry, Dennis has 
had an impressive career in the public sector. 
His remarkable journey began as a teacher in 
the Long Beach Unified School District in 
1964. As an educator, Dennis worked dili-
gently to ensure that every child received 
equal access to quality education. In 1968, he 
became one of California’s youngest school 
principals, serving first at the Earlimart Ele-
mentary School in Tulare and later at the 
Fountain Valley Elementary School in Orange 
County. 

Dennis’s devotion to improving our edu-
cational system continued with him as a Cali-
fornia State Assemblyman. Elected in 1976, 
he quickly became the chair of the Sub-
committee on Educational Reform. This al-
lowed him to lead the State Legislative Task 
Force for the Improvement of Pre- and In- 
Service Training for School Administrators. 
This program helped recruit teachers and 
school administrators for California’s edu-
cational system. Additionally, during his time in 
the Assembly, Dennis authored the Gifted and 
Talented Education Act (GATE). The GATE 
program is now a staple of California’s edu-
cational system and allows for unique edu-
cational opportunities for students who have 
been identified as high achieving. 

From his love for singing, to his enthusiasm 
for education, to his years giving back to the 
public as an elected official, Dennis has expe-
rienced many great things in his lifetime while 
also being active with many nonprofits. 
Throughout his career Dennis has cham-
pioned tolerance and appreciation of diversity 
in the Sacramento region and across Cali-
fornia. Dennis was a founding member and 
currently serves as the chairman of the board 
of directors for the Capitol Unity Council. The 
council was formed after the murder of a gay 
couple and the torching of three of Sac-
ramento’s synagogues in 1999. The council 
works to promote tolerance in the community, 
and Dennis has been leading the effort to 
build a center for diversity in downtown Sac-
ramento. Thanks to his vision, this project is 
moving forward and upon completion will 
serve as an interactive learning experience 
where youth and visitors will engage in pro-
grams and activities that embrace inclusion, 
honor California’s diversity, and motivate peo-
ple to play an active role in building unity in 
their communities. 

Madam Speaker, I am honored to recognize 
the numerous contributions made by Dennis 
during his lifetime of service. During his career 
he has worked tirelessly to further causes he 
believes in and has touched many people’s 
lives both directly and indirectly. On behalf of 
the people of Sacramento and the Fifth Con-
gressional District of California, I ask all my 
colleagues to join me in thanking my friend, 
Dennis Mangers, for his public service as we 
wish him success in his future endeavors. 
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Mr. PAUL. Mr. Speaker, I am pleased to 
support H. Con. Res. 1145, which recognizes 
the 100-year anniversary of the establishment 
of St. Mary’s Cooperative Credit Association. 
Created to service the financial needs of tex-
tile workers, St. Mary’s Cooperative Credit As-
sociation, or the People’s Bank, as it was ap-
propriately renamed, was the Nation’s first 
credit union. 

Since the creation of St. Mary’s Cooperative 
Credit Association, credit unions have grown 
to become a major part of the American finan-
cial services system. Today there are over 
8,500 credit unions in the United States, serv-
ing over 90 million members. 

During my years of service on the House 
Committee on Financial Services, I have had 
the opportunity to get to know many credit 
union employees. I have always been im-
pressed with their commitment to serving their 
credit union members and their communities. 
In many ways, credit unions exemplify the 
best of the free market system. Since credit 
unions are formed specifically to serve their 
members, credit unions put the interests of 
their depositors first. 

I hope that Congress will follow-up today’s 
legislation by soon considering H.R. 5519, the 
Credit Union Regulatory Relief Act of 2008, 
which repeals Federal regulations that hinder 
credit unions from improving their services. 

In conclusion, Mr. Speaker, I am pleased to 
support H. Con. Res. 1145, and I encourage 
all my colleagues to join me in supporting this 
resolution and saluting all credit unions for 
their vital role in strengthening America’s fi-
nancial services industry. 
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Mr. TANNER. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
to honor the accomplishments of Dr. Paul E. 
Gallis, specialist in European Affairs with the 
Foreign Affairs, Defense, and Trade Division 
of the Congressional Research Service. Dr. 
Gallis is retiring on July 3, 2008, after serving 
the Nation for approximately 28 years in var-

ious positions at CRS, in the Senate, and in 
the State Department. In particular, Dr. Gallis 
served the Congress for 24 years as an expert 
in and objective observer of European security 
affairs. He has been the institutional memory 
of Congress on vital transatlantic political and 
security issues spanning multiple Congresses, 
several U.S. administrations, and key events 
in foreign policy. He has been an especially 
valued resource to Members and committees 
in Congress on all matters relating to the 
NATO alliance and relations with our Euro-
pean allies. 

Dr. Gallis started working at CRS in June 
1984 as an analyst in West European affairs. 
He came to CRS after working for 3 years in 
the office of Senator JOSEPH BIDEN as a policy 
advisor and speech writer. Before that, he 
served as a special assistant to Ambassador 
Rozanne Ridgway at the Department of State. 
Dr. Gallis received an M.A. and Ph.D. in Euro-
pean history at Brown University, and a B.A. 
in history and French from Davidson College. 
He studied at the École des Hautes Études in 
Paris, France. 

Dr. Gallis quickly emerged as a leading 
CRS expert on European security affairs. His 
early work focused on vital and often con-
troversial cold war-era security issues such as 
the Strategic Defense Initiative, SDI, and allied 
responses; the conventional arms balance in 
Europe; and policy issues surrounding the In-
termediate-Range Nuclear Force, INF, Treaty. 
With the end of the cold war, Dr. Gallis’s work 
incorporated significant changes in the trans-
atlantic relationship, turning to burdensharing 
issues surrounding the first Persian Gulf war, 
as well as international diplomacy leading to 
Germany’s unification. 

Throughout his career at CRS, Dr. Gallis 
served as an authority on NATO political af-
fairs and the allied relationship. He produced 
numerous timely reports on NATO’s missions 
and institutional processes, including alliance 
partnership programs and enlargement. He led 
or coordinated important studies on NATO’s 
emerging operational challenges in the Bal-
kans and in Afghanistan. Over the telephone 
and in person, Dr. Gallis frequently shared his 
expertise on these difficult issues with tact and 
judgment. His work informed thousands of 
Members and staff in congressional offices 
over the years as they grappled with the com-
plex foreign policy and security issues of the 
day in hearings, legislative initiatives, and on-
going consultations with U.S. and foreign offi-
cials. In all of his work, Dr. Gallis upheld an 
unswerving commitment to the core CRS mis-
sion of supporting an informed national legisla-
ture with nonpartisan research and analysis. 

In addition to the above, Dr. Gallis spent 
several years at CRS handling managerial du-
ties as head of the Europe, Middle East, and 
Africa section of the Foreign Affairs Division. 
In this capacity he supervised the work of 
many CRS analysts and instilled in them his 
high standard of work and professionalism. He 
represented the Library of Congress at the 
National War College in 1991–1992. 

I got to know Dr. Gallis personally in the 
context of his many years of intensive work 
with Congressional delegations to the NATO 
Parliamentary Assembly. For the past several 
years, Dr. Gallis has been asked to serve as 
lead policy staff for delegations to the regular 
meetings of the NPA. In this capacity he has 
taken on yeoman’s work in coordinating pre-
paratory research analysis for delegation 
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